Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 06-0U2904 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 5

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC0000020938	Griffith Company
VC0000021062	Security Paving Company Inc
VC0000021515	C.A. Rasmussen, Inc.
VC000000213	Granite Construction Company
VC1900003135	Genuine Engineering Inc

Letting ID: 06-0U2904 0701 Letting Date: 07/01/2025 Contract ID: 06-0U2904 Vendor Name: Griffith Company Cost total: \$30,715,735.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$30,715,735.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN KERN COUNTY NEAR BAKERSFIELD FROM WHARTON AVENUE TO EDISON HIGHWAY In District 06 On Route 184 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0616000001 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: A24C7A1C05 Bid Creation Checksum: N4bKvYHxV0NhqIbNP2OLk8HaFBJ1jEUtbI9lUMwYXAI= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 88 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:

California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-0U2904 0701 Letting Date: 07/01/2025 Contract ID: 06-0U2904 Vendor Name: Security Paving Company Inc Cost total: \$34,218,608.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$34,218,608.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN KERN COUNTY NEAR BAKERSFIELD FROM WHARTON AVENUE TO EDISON HIGHWAY In District 06 On Route 184 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0616000001 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: C718A001BF Bid Creation Checksum: N4bKvYHxV0NhqIbNP2OLk8HaFBJ1jEUtbI9lUMwYXAI= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 116307 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:

California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-0U2904 0701 Letting Date: 07/01/2025 Contract ID: 06-0U2904 Vendor Name: C.A. Rasmussen, Inc. Cost total: \$37,713,043.80 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$37,713,043.80 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN KERN COUNTY NEAR BAKERSFIELD FROM WHARTON AVENUE TO EDISON HIGHWAY In District 06 On Route 184 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0616000001 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 7681327D7B Bid Creation Checksum: N4bKvYHxV0NhqIbNP2OLk8HaFBJ1jEUtbI9lUMwYXAI= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 254681 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-0U2904 0701 Letting Date: 07/01/2025 Contract ID: 06-0U2904 Vendor Name: Granite Construction Company Cost total: \$39,695,174.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$39,695,174.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN KERN COUNTY NEAR BAKERSFIELD FROM WHARTON AVENUE TO EDISON HIGHWAY In District 06 On Route 184 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0616000001 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: BE806682EB Bid Creation Checksum: N4bKvYHxV0NhqIbNP2OLk8HaFBJ1jEUtbI9lUMwYXAI= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 89 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:

Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-0U2904 0701 Letting Date: 07/01/2025 Contract ID: 06-0U2904 Vendor Name: Genuine Engineering Inc Cost total: \$46,328,586.50 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$46,328,586.50 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN KERN COUNTY NEAR BAKERSFIELD FROM WHARTON AVENUE TO EDISON HIGHWAY In District 06 On Route 184 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0616000001 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: C252C6D91E Bid Creation Checksum: N4bKvYHxV0NhqIbNP2OLk8HaFBJ1jEUtbI9lUMwYXAI= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1039391 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:

California Company Preference: not No