Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 01-0N8204 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 7

| Bidder ID | Vendor Name |
|--------------|---------------------------------|
| VC2100001318 | Doolittle Road Construction |
| VC0000017652 | Argonaut Constructors |
| VC0000014187 | Ghilotti Construction Co. |
| VC0000019628 | DRYCO Construction, Inc. |
| VC0000021841 | Pavement Coatings Co. |
| VC1300003799 | VSS International, Inc. |
| VC0000016849 | Sierra Nevada Construction, Inc |

Letting ID: 01-0N8204 Letting Date: 04/03/2025 Contract ID: 01-0N8204 Vendor Name: Doolittle Road Construction Cost total: \$1,029,000.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,029,000.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN LAKE COUNTY NEAR KELSEYVILLE FROM 3.23 MILES NORTH OF SEIGLER CREEK BRIDGE TO COLE CREEK ROAD In District 01 On Route 29 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0124000115 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 88429F1301 Bid Creation Checksum: FjMvIu535ErbBG9SSqb6jNoMBSVvtjJ8UOBkQ0V6KWM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1066710 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:requests California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 01-0N8204 Letting Date: 04/03/2025 Contract ID: 01-0N8204 Vendor Name: Argonaut Constructors Cost total: \$1,030,986.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,030,986.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN LAKE COUNTY NEAR KELSEYVILLE FROM 3.23 MILES NORTH OF SEIGLER CREEK BRIDGE TO COLE CREEK ROAD In District 01 On Route 29 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0124000115 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: OBC5E67168 Bid Creation Checksum: FjMvIu535ErbBG9SSqb6jNoMBSVvtjJ8UOBkQ0V6KWM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 171432 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 01-0N8204 Letting Date: 04/03/2025 Contract ID: 01-0N8204 Vendor Name: Ghilotti Construction Co. Cost total: \$1,089,276.50 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,089,276.50 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN LAKE COUNTY NEAR KELSEYVILLE FROM 3.23 MILES NORTH OF SEIGLER CREEK BRIDGE TO COLE CREEK ROAD In District 01 On Route 29 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0124000115 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: E22F7CC58C Bid Creation Checksum: FjMvIu535ErbBG9SSqb6jNoMBSVvtjJ8UOBkQ0V6KWM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 644515 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 01-0N8204 Letting Date: 04/03/2025 Contract ID: 01-0N8204 Vendor Name: DRYCO Construction, Inc. Cost total: \$1,117,117.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,117,117.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN LAKE COUNTY NEAR KELSEYVILLE FROM 3.23 MILES NORTH OF SEIGLER CREEK BRIDGE TO COLE CREEK ROAD In District 01 On Route 29 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0124000115 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: A2EC6AD518 Bid Creation Checksum: FjMvIu535ErbBG9SSqb6jNoMBSVvtjJ8UOBkQ0V6KWM= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 540379 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:requests California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 01-0N8204 Letting Date: 04/03/2025 Contract ID: 01-0N8204 Vendor Name: Pavement Coatings Co. Cost total: \$1,154,129.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,154,129.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN LAKE COUNTY NEAR KELSEYVILLE FROM 3.23 MILES NORTH OF SEIGLER CREEK BRIDGE TO COLE CREEK ROAD In District 01 On Route 29 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0124000115 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 11E9727B39 Bid Creation Checksum: FjMvIu535ErbBG9SSqb6jNoMBSVvtjJ8UOBkQ0V6KWM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 303609 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 01-0N8204 Letting Date: 04/03/2025 Contract ID: 01-0N8204 Vendor Name: VSS International, Inc. Cost total: \$1,163,325.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,163,325.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN LAKE COUNTY NEAR KELSEYVILLE FROM 3.23 MILES NORTH OF SEIGLER CREEK BRIDGE TO COLE CREEK ROAD In District 01 On Route 29 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0124000115 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 7DF4A3DD7B Bid Creation Checksum: FjMvIu535ErbBG9SSqb6jNoMBSVvtjJ8UOBkQ0V6KWM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 293727 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:requests California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 01-0N8204 Letting Date: 04/03/2025 Contract ID: 01-0N8204 Vendor Name: Sierra Nevada Construction, Inc Cost total: \$1,224,007.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,224,007.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN LAKE COUNTY NEAR KELSEYVILLE FROM 3.23 MILES NORTH OF SEIGLER CREEK BRIDGE TO COLE CREEK ROAD In District 01 On Route 29 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0124000115 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: E9C7BDA1B8 Bid Creation Checksum: FjMvIu535ErbBG9SSqb6jNoMBSVvtjJ8UOBkQ0V6KWM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 593393 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:requests California Company Preference: not No

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 06-1G8104 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 4

| Bidder ID | Vendor Name |
|--------------|-------------------------------|
| VC2500001998 | Archer Civil Construction |
| VC1300003023 | CAL VALLEY CONSTRUCTION, INC. |
| VC000000213 | Granite Construction Company |
| VC0000101366 | Papich Construction Co., Inc. |

Letting ID: 06-1G8104 Letting Date: 04/03/2025 Contract ID: 06-1G8104 Vendor Name: Archer Civil Construction Cost total: \$1,489,476.32 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,489,476.32 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN TULARE COUNTY AT AND NEAR CUTLER AND OROSI FROM AVENUE 384 TO AVENUE 422 In District 06 On Route 63 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0624000168 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 74C0A5FD52 Bid Creation Checksum: KZ7kq482+x0b+1GMXD0AWr6IPL8vtQYxhDc36uVMGxQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1128012 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 06-1G8104 Letting Date: 04/03/2025 Contract ID: 06-1G8104 Vendor Name: CAL VALLEY CONSTRUCTION, INC. Cost total: \$1,716,753.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,716,753.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN TULARE COUNTY AT AND NEAR CUTLER AND OROSI FROM AVENUE 384 TO AVENUE 422 In District 06 On Route 63 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0624000168 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 88C4D8BB47 Bid Creation Checksum: KZ7kq482+x0b+1GMXD0AWr6IPL8vtQYxhDc36uVMGxQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 873800 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:requests

Letting ID: 06-1G8104 Letting Date: 04/03/2025 Contract ID: 06-1G8104 Vendor Name: Granite Construction Company Cost total: \$1,784,891.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,784,891.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN TULARE COUNTY AT AND NEAR CUTLER AND OROSI FROM AVENUE 384 TO AVENUE 422 In District 06 On Route 63 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0624000168 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 2A27D1471A Bid Creation Checksum: KZ7kq482+x0b+1GMXD0AWr6IPL8vtQYxhDc36uVMGxQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 89 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:

Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-1G8104 Letting Date: 04/03/2025 Contract ID: 06-1G8104 Vendor Name: Papich Construction Co., Inc. Cost total: \$1,939,939.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,939,939.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN TULARE COUNTY AT AND NEAR CUTLER AND OROSI FROM AVENUE 384 TO AVENUE 422 In District 06 On Route 63 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0624000168 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: A40A3659DD Bid Creation Checksum: KZ7kq482+x0b+1GMXD0AWr6IPL8vtQYxhDc36uVMGxQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 767055 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 11-2N2304 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 4

| Bidder ID | Vendor Name |
|--------------|---------------------------------|
| VC0000021841 | Pavement Coatings Co. |
| VC2200003953 | SB General Engineering, Inc. |
| VC0000101052 | Intermountain Slurry Seal, Inc. |
| VC1300003799 | VSS International, Inc. |

Letting ID: 11-2N2304 Letting Date: 04/03/2025 Contract ID: 11-2N2304 Vendor Name: Pavement Coatings Co. Cost total: \$2,198,568.38 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,198,568.38 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN IMPERIAL COUNTY IN AND NEAR EL CENTRO AND BRAWLEY FROM MCCABE ROAD TO IMPERIAL AVENUE AND FROM I STREET TO 0.3 MILE NORTH OF NEW RIVER BRIDGE In District 11 On Route 86 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1124000188 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: A53A8D2232 Bid Creation Checksum: oUv/YrrxZXL0pvt28yLG27k/2zGd60V7iQ+9V0C9Ia0= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 303609 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 11-2N2304 Letting Date: 04/03/2025 Contract ID: 11-2N2304 Vendor Name: SB General Engineering, Inc. Cost total: \$2,380,353.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,380,353.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN IMPERIAL COUNTY IN AND NEAR EL CENTRO AND BRAWLEY FROM MCCABE ROAD TO IMPERIAL AVENUE AND FROM I STREET TO 0.3 MILE NORTH OF NEW RIVER BRIDGE In District 11 On Route 86 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1124000188 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: CCC1B94137 Bid Creation Checksum: oUv/YrrxZXL0pvt28yLG27k/2zGd60V7iQ+9V0C9Ia0= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 721885 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 11-2N2304 Letting Date: 04/03/2025 Contract ID: 11-2N2304 Vendor Name: Intermountain Slurry Seal, Inc. Cost total: \$2,620,006.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,620,006.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN IMPERIAL COUNTY IN AND NEAR EL CENTRO AND BRAWLEY FROM MCCABE ROAD TO IMPERIAL AVENUE AND FROM I STREET TO 0.3 MILE NORTH OF NEW RIVER BRIDGE In District 11 On Route 86 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1124000188 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 3168832EAB Bid Creation Checksum: oUv/YrrxZXL0pvt28yLG27k/2zGd60V7iQ+9V0C9Ia0= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 462443 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 11-2N2304 Letting Date: 04/03/2025 Contract ID: 11-2N2304 Vendor Name: VSS International, Inc. Cost total: \$2,860,120.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,860,120.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN IMPERIAL COUNTY IN AND NEAR EL CENTRO AND BRAWLEY FROM MCCABE ROAD TO IMPERIAL AVENUE AND FROM I STREET TO 0.3 MILE NORTH OF NEW RIVER BRIDGE In District 11 On Route 86 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1124000188 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: AD11AF101D Bid Creation Checksum: oUv/YrrxZXL0pvt28yLG27k/2zGd60V7iQ+9V0C9Ia0= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 293727 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No