## Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 06-1G8204 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 7

| Bidder ID    | Vendor Name   |
|--------------|---|
| VC2500001998 | Archer Civil Construction                           |
| VC000000213  | Granite Construction Company                        |
| VC0000013950 | A. Teichert and Son, Inc. dba Teichert Construction |
| VC1400004868 | Yarbs Grading and Paving, Inc.                      |
| VC0000015783 | Agee Construction Corporation                       |
| VC1300003023 | CAL VALLEY CONSTRUCTION, INC.                       |
| VC0000101366 | Papich Construction Co., Inc.                       |

Letting ID: 06-1G8204 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 06-1G8204 Vendor Name: Archer Civil Construction Cost total: \$3,782,111.17 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,782,111.17 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN FRESNO COUNTY IN AND NEAR MENDOTA FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF KAMM AVENUE TO MOUNTAIN VIEW AVENUE AND FROM ADAMS AVENUE TO BELMONT AVENUE In District 06 On Route 33 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0624000169 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: DC170B27AE Bid Creation Checksum: SouYGfUbEq8myoMoEPDT4hOYFx2MklQ4mFDyz1Mxlcw= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 1128012 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-1G8204 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 06-1G8204 Vendor Name: Granite Construction Company Cost total: \$3,839,815.50 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,839,815.50 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN FRESNO COUNTY IN AND NEAR MENDOTA FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF KAMM AVENUE TO MOUNTAIN VIEW AVENUE AND FROM ADAMS AVENUE TO BELMONT AVENUE In District 06 On Route 33 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0624000169 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: B713E3C755 Bid Creation Checksum: SouYGfUbEq8myoMoEPDT4hOYFx2MklQ4mFDyz1Mxlcw= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 89 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-1G8204 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 06-1G8204 Vendor Name: A. Teichert and Son, Inc. dba Teichert Construction Cost total: \$4,139,000.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$4,139,000.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN FRESNO COUNTY IN AND NEAR MENDOTA FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF KAMM AVENUE TO MOUNTAIN VIEW AVENUE AND FROM ADAMS AVENUE TO BELMONT AVENUE In District 06 On Route 33 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0624000169 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 0751E29088 Bid Creation Checksum: SouYGfUbEq8myoMoEPDT4hOYFx2MklQ4mFDyz1Mxlcw= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 8 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-1G8204 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 06-1G8204 Vendor Name: Yarbs Grading and Paving, Inc. Cost total: \$4,230,688.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$4,230,688.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN FRESNO COUNTY IN AND NEAR MENDOTA FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF KAMM AVENUE TO MOUNTAIN VIEW AVENUE AND FROM ADAMS AVENUE TO BELMONT AVENUE In District 06 On Route 33 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0624000169 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 05D6473F8A Bid Creation Checksum: SouYGfUbEq8myoMoEPDT4hOYFx2MklQ4mFDyz1Mxlcw= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 964071 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-1G8204 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 06-1G8204 Vendor Name: Agee Construction Corporation Cost total: \$4,435,643.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$4,435,643.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN FRESNO COUNTY IN AND NEAR MENDOTA FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF KAMM AVENUE TO MOUNTAIN VIEW AVENUE AND FROM ADAMS AVENUE TO BELMONT AVENUE In District 06 On Route 33 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0624000169 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 12FB19C830 Bid Creation Checksum: SouYGfUbEq8myoMoEPDT4hOYFx2MklQ4mFDyz1Mxlcw= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 631980 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-1G8204 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 06-1G8204 Vendor Name: CAL VALLEY CONSTRUCTION, INC. Cost total: \$4,759,662.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$4,759,662.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN FRESNO COUNTY IN AND NEAR MENDOTA FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF KAMM AVENUE TO MOUNTAIN VIEW AVENUE AND FROM ADAMS AVENUE TO BELMONT AVENUE In District 06 On Route 33 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0624000169 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: DC12FE9F90 Bid Creation Checksum: SouYGfUbEq8myoMoEPDT4hOYFx2MklQ4mFDyz1Mxlcw= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 873800 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:requests California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-1G8204 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 06-1G8204 Vendor Name: Papich Construction Co., Inc. Cost total: \$5,092,209.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$5,092,209.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN FRESNO COUNTY IN AND NEAR MENDOTA FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF KAMM AVENUE TO MOUNTAIN VIEW AVENUE AND FROM ADAMS AVENUE TO BELMONT AVENUE In District 06 On Route 33 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0624000169 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: AFCEFC4B7D Bid Creation Checksum: SouYGfUbEq8myoMoEPDT4hOYFx2MklQ4mFDyz1Mxlcw= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 767055 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

## Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 07-332304 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 7

| Bidder ID    | Vendor Name                       |
|--------------|-----------------------------------|
| VC0000100657 | Toro Enterprises Inc.             |
| VC2100003423 | Interstate Civil Construction     |
| VC000000213  | Granite Construction Company      |
| VC1200005673 | A.M. Concrete, Inc.               |
| VC000008361  | Beador Construction Company, Inc. |
| VC000006260  | Autobahn Construction, Inc.       |
| VC0000103709 | Union Engineering Company, Inc.   |

Letting ID: 07-332304 0114 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 07-332304 Vendor Name: Toro Enterprises Inc. Cost total: \$3,725,967.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,725,967.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN VENTURA COUNTY NEAR OJAI FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF BEAR CREEK BRIDGE TO 0.1 MILE NORTH OF NORTH FORK MATILIJA CREEK BRIDGE In District 07 On Route 33 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0716000257 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: E792BF92ED Bid Creation Checksum: V8jM3WoXf2Anj7zprnsVJ2aHW2rX+8gOM/gxUvv2EBw= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 710580 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-332304 0114 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 07-332304 Vendor Name: Interstate Civil Construction Cost total: \$3,763,146.80 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,763,146.80 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN VENTURA COUNTY NEAR OJAI FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF BEAR CREEK BRIDGE TO 0.1 MILE NORTH OF NORTH FORK MATILIJA CREEK BRIDGE In District 07 On Route 33 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0716000257 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 15B7CCA7F5 Bid Creation Checksum: V8jM3WoXf2Anj7zprnsVJ2aHW2rX+8gOM/qxUvv2EBw= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1074144 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-332304 0114 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 07-332304 Vendor Name: Granite Construction Company Cost total: \$3,791,791.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,791,791.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN VENTURA COUNTY NEAR OJAI FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF BEAR CREEK BRIDGE TO 0.1 MILE NORTH OF NORTH FORK MATILIJA CREEK BRIDGE In District 07 On Route 33 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0716000257 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 7568E76643 Bid Creation Checksum: V8jM3WoXf2Anj7zprnsVJ2aHW2rX+8gOM/gxUvv2EBw= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 89 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-332304 0114 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 07-332304 Vendor Name: A.M. Concrete, Inc. Cost total: \$3,856,013.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,856,013.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN VENTURA COUNTY NEAR OJAI FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF BEAR CREEK BRIDGE TO 0.1 MILE NORTH OF NORTH FORK MATILIJA CREEK BRIDGE In District 07 On Route 33 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0716000257 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 46C12C6A72 Bid Creation Checksum: V8jM3WoXf2Anj7zprnsVJ2aHW2rX+8gOM/qxUvv2EBw= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 446850 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-332304 0114 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 07-332304 Vendor Name: Beador Construction Company, Inc. Cost total: \$4,570,300.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$4,570,300.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN VENTURA COUNTY NEAR OJAI FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF BEAR CREEK BRIDGE TO 0.1 MILE NORTH OF NORTH FORK MATILIJA CREEK BRIDGE In District 07 On Route 33 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0716000257 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 7EED0044D7 Bid Creation Checksum: V8jM3WoXf2Anj7zprnsVJ2aHW2rX+8gOM/gxUvv2EBw= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 720483 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-332304 0114 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 07-332304 Vendor Name: Autobahn Construction, Inc. Cost total: \$4,711,276.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$4,711,276.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN VENTURA COUNTY NEAR OJAI FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF BEAR CREEK BRIDGE TO 0.1 MILE NORTH OF NORTH FORK MATILIJA CREEK BRIDGE In District 07 On Route 33 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0716000257 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: F90EA5B06D Bid Creation Checksum: V8jM3WoXf2Anj7zprnsVJ2aHW2rX+8gOM/qxUvv2EBw= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 676837 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-332304 0114 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 07-332304 Vendor Name: Union Engineering Company, Inc. Cost total: \$7,193,264.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$7,193,264.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN VENTURA COUNTY NEAR OJAI FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF BEAR CREEK BRIDGE TO 0.1 MILE NORTH OF NORTH FORK MATILIJA CREEK BRIDGE In District 07 On Route 33 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0716000257 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 270D10100C Bid Creation Checksum: V8jM3WoXf2Anj7zprnsVJ2aHW2rX+8qOM/qxUvv2EBw= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 212942 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

## Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 11-2N1974 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 4

| Bidder ID    | Vendor Name                     |
|--------------|---------------------------------|
| VC000008369  | Hazard Construction Engr, LLC   |
| VC0000101052 | Intermountain Slurry Seal, Inc. |
| VC1300003799 | VSS International, Inc.         |
| VC0000021841 | Pavement Coatings Co.           |

Letting ID: 11-2N1974 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 11-2N1974 Vendor Name: Hazard Construction Engr, LLC Cost total: \$1,658,805.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,658,805.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN IMPERIAL COUNTY NEAR BRAWLEY AND CALIPATRIA AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.2 MILE SOUTH OF ROUTE 78 TO 0.4 MILE SOUTH OF ROUTE 115 In District 11 On Route 111 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1123000094 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 194AD44976 Bid Creation Checksum: dJe0pohRTn8j2sR9cg52oP4OdLaGL/YkWpk9MDpEVsI= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1038899 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 11-2N1974 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 11-2N1974 Vendor Name: Intermountain Slurry Seal, Inc. Cost total: \$1,672,222.50 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,672,222.50 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN IMPERIAL COUNTY NEAR BRAWLEY AND CALIPATRIA AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.2 MILE SOUTH OF ROUTE 78 TO 0.4 MILE SOUTH OF ROUTE 115 In District 11 On Route 111 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1123000094 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: B12EC8C21B Bid Creation Checksum: dJe0pohRTn8j2sR9cg52oP4OdLaGL/YkWpk9MDpEVsI= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 462443 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:requests California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 11-2N1974 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 11-2N1974 Vendor Name: VSS International, Inc. Cost total: \$1,888,120.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,888,120.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN IMPERIAL COUNTY NEAR BRAWLEY AND CALIPATRIA AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.2 MILE SOUTH OF ROUTE 78 TO 0.4 MILE SOUTH OF ROUTE 115 In District 11 On Route 111 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1123000094 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 8D77C43CDD Bid Creation Checksum: dJe0pohRTn8j2sR9cg52oP4OdLaGL/YkWpk9MDpEVsI= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 293727 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 11-2N1974 Letting Date: 01/14/2025 Contract ID: 11-2N1974 Vendor Name: Pavement Coatings Co. Cost total: \$1,950,653.40 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Dav Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,950,653.40 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN IMPERIAL COUNTY NEAR BRAWLEY AND CALIPATRIA AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.2 MILE SOUTH OF ROUTE 78 TO 0.4 MILE SOUTH OF ROUTE 115 In District 11 On Route 111 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1123000094 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 92F0D6CA9D Bid Creation Checksum: dJe0pohRTn8j2sR9cg52oP4OdLaGL/YkWpk9MDpEVsI= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 303609 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:requests California Company Preference: not No